
This is a repository copy of Infectious Injustice: The political foundations of the Ebola crisis
in Sierra Leone.

White Rose Research Online URL for this paper:
https://eprints.whiterose.ac.uk/id/eprint/90600/

Version: Accepted Version

Article:

Anderson, E-L and Beresford, A (2016) Infectious Injustice: The political foundations of the 
Ebola crisis in Sierra Leone. Third World Quarterly, 37 (3). pp. 468-486. ISSN 0143-6597

https://doi.org/10.1080/01436597.2015.1103175

eprints@whiterose.ac.uk
https://eprints.whiterose.ac.uk/

Reuse 

Items deposited in White Rose Research Online are protected by copyright, with all rights reserved unless 
indicated otherwise. They may be downloaded and/or printed for private study, or other acts as permitted by 
national copyright laws. The publisher or other rights holders may allow further reproduction and re-use of 
the full text version. This is indicated by the licence information on the White Rose Research Online record 
for the item. 

Takedown 

If you consider content in White Rose Research Online to be in breach of UK law, please notify us by 
emailing eprints@whiterose.ac.uk including the URL of the record and the reason for the withdrawal request. 

mailto:eprints@whiterose.ac.uk
https://doi.org/10.1080/01436597.2015.1103175
https://eprints.whiterose.ac.uk/id/eprint/90600/
https://eprints.whiterose.ac.uk/


1 

 

Infectious Injustice: The political foundations of the Ebola crisis in Sierra 

Leone  
 
Emma-Louise Anderson

i
 & Alexander Beresford

ii
  

Third World Quarterly 

 

Abstract: This article identifies the long-term political factors that contributed to the Ebola 
crisis in Sierra Leone, which are largely overlooked by the emerging international focus on 
building resilient health systems. We argue that the country exhibits critical symptoms of the 
recurrent crises of a gatekeeper state, including: acute external dependency, patron-client 
politics, endemic corruption, and weak state capacity. A coterie of actors, both internal and 
external to Sierra Leone, has severally compromised the health system. This left certain 
sections of the population acutely at risk from Ebola and highlights the need for political 
solutions to build stronger, inclusive health systems. 

 

Keywords: Global health, health systems strengthening, Ebola Virus Disease (EVD), 
gatekeeper state, patronage politics, Sierra Leone 

 

Introduction  

According to the World Health Organisation (WHO), one of the core reasons the Ebola Virus 
Disease (EVD) spread so extensively in Sierra Leone, Liberia and Guinea was that their 
health systems ‘lacked resilience’ and that as a result, ‘when the crisis struck, the countries 
had no reserve capacity to mount an effective and timely response.’ The WHO argued that 
these countries’ health systems suffered from particular structural weaknesses, including an 
insufficient number of health workers who were poorly distributed across the country, and 
inadequate surveillance and information systems for oversight. The report identified further 
weaknesses such as ‘absent or weak rapid response systems, few laboratories mainly located 
in cities, unreliable supply and procurement systems for PPEs [personal protective 
equipment] and other supplies, lack of electricity and running water in some health facilities 
and few ambulances.’1  
     This article focuses on Sierra Leone where the number of infections eclipsed the other 
countries (reaching 13,683) and new cases continue to be reported in September 2015.2 
Indeed, the weakness of Sierra Leone’s health infrastructure was exposed by the EVD 
epidemic. Hospitals were already understaffed and under resourced to cope with everyday 
health challenges, including maternal health and endemic Malaria. In 2008, there were only 
95 physicians and 991 nurses and midwives, equating to 2 physicians and 18 nurses and 
midwives per 100,000 people.3 As a result, some of Sierra Leone’s health indicators, 
including life expectancy (45 years) and death rate (17 per 1000 people), remain persistently 
among the worst in the world.4 
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the structural determinants of health in Africa. Her monograph Gender, Risk and HIV and article in the International 
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International Studies (POLIS), University of Leeds, Leeds, LS2 9JT Email: E.L.Anderson@Leeds.ac.uk Tel: 0113 3434924 
ii Dr Alexander Beresford is a Lecturer in the Politics of African Development at the University of Leeds and a Senior 
Research Associate in the Centre for Social Change at the University of Johannesburg. His monograph South Africa's 
Political Crisis and article in African Affairs examine patronage politics in Africa. 
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     The international community’s response to the EVD epidemic was to promote a 
containment strategy. The President of Sierra Leone, Ernest Bai Koroma, ordered the 
quarantine of EVD ‘epicentres’ and military personnel were deployed to establish roadblocks, 
and clinics were built to try and isolate infected people.5 The UK was among the countries 
leading the international response, which was directed largely by its armed forces with the 
support of health organisations such as Medecins Sans Frontieres (MSF). The virus was 
eventually contained and by August 2015 a successful trial of the VSV-EBOV vaccine was 
hailed as a ‘game-changer’ by one Assistant Director-General  of the WHO.6  
     However, the eventual success of the containment strategy should not provoke celebration 
but instead a prolonged period of detailed introspection among the actors involved. Indeed, 
the scale of the crisis is argued to present an opportunity to galvanise renewed commitment to 
long-term health systems strengthening (HSS). In this vein, the WHO Executive Board on the 
Ebola Emergency argue that ‘Media interest, technical support, and financial resources have 
surged into these countries. This creates a window of opportunity for reinforced action on 
health systems strengthening that lays the groundwork in the affected countries for universal 
access to safe, high quality health services’.7 This sentiment is echoed by those on the ground 
who led the emergency response, including the head of the MSF mission in Sierra Leone, 
who contends that 

 
It is clear that the work to improve healthcare in Sierra Leone will not end with the 
epidemic. Even before Ebola, Sierra Leone suffered from an acute shortage of skilled 
staff, limiting access for the population to key life-saving services. After the loss of 
more than 220 health workers to Ebola, there is a real need, not for just funding and 
promises, but for skilled clinicians on the ground across the country.’8 
  

Building more resilient health systems has thus become almost an article of faith for 
international donors and NGOs.9   

Our concern here is with the need to broaden the scope of these reflections to include a 
focus on the political foundations of the EVD epidemic.10 In short, the task before us is not 
simply to enhance short-term resilience to health crises, but to tackle the very roots of 
endemically weak health systems in the first place. The IR scholarship and much of the 
Global Health scholarship more specifically are traditionally ill-equipped to respond to this 
challenge: as Harman and Brown argue, this is not simply a question of Africa’s omission,11 
but there is often disconnect between the ‘discipline’s theoretical constructs and Africa 
realities’.12  

We will elucidate below how the weakness of the health system reflects an extreme 
manifestation of the recurring political crises afflicting many of Africa’s ‘gatekeeper states’, 
including: acute external dependency, patron-client politics, endemic corruption, and a weak 
state unable to provide basic services and protections to its population.13 Since the country’s 
devastating civil war (1991-2002), the country has become what Harris describes as a 
‘laboratory’ for liberal experiments in state building and governance.14 We argue that as 
powerful external actors endeavour to protect their investments and decentralise power, the 
creation of multiple parallel health systems complicate health provision and entrench 
dysfunction. Within this context, the potential for rent-seeking among politicians and local 
health professionals is particularly acute in a sector that attracts such high volumes of 
external resources. The lack of capacity for oversight has reproduced an environment in 
which local actors invert external interventions – including, in this case, those designed to the 
contain EVD epidemic - for private gain. Therefore, while the vast majority of Sierra 
Leoneans working to combat the spread of EVD have done so with great courage and at 
considerable personal risk, the rent-seeking behaviour of some government officials and 
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health care professionals has nonetheless diverted substantial resources away from this effort. 
Furthermore, the manner in which the epidemic spread in Sierra Leone highlights the 
structural violence that permeates society: where social structures (including economic, 
political, legal, religious, and cultural structures) engender inequality, they prevent 
individuals or groups from achieving their full potential and expose them to risk.15  

The core challenge ahead remains to augment stronger, inclusive health systems. While 
the latest emphasis on health system ‘resilience’ may help contain future outbreaks, such a 
focus ultimately reflects a desire to manage the public health risks generated from the fallout 
of late capitalism and the global inequities that it produces. Broad-based HSS, on the other 
hand, is a much more ambitious project of social transformation tackling, as best it can, the 
roots of structural violence. This requires long-term commitment to finding political solutions 
to health problems that address the reasons why populations are at risk in the first place. 
 

The recurrent crises of the gatekeeper state 

Like their colonial predecessors, Africa’s post-colonial elites often struggled to extend their 
power and control over the entirety of their states. First, these states were weak from their 
very inception owing to seemingly arbitrary demarcation of their borders, which reflected the 
European colonial rivalries of the late nineteenth century, rather than the political and social 
realities of African societies. Second, Africa’s post-colonial leaders inherited economies that 
had been orientated towards servicing external demands for African resources and rarely 
generated sufficient economic growth to sustain industrial diversification or an expansionary 
fiscal programme that was not entirely dependent on external aid, loans and other forms of 
development assistance. As Cooper notes, a ‘gatekeeper state’ complex therefore prevails in 
many Africa states. Political elites in office attempt to reproduce their power as best they can 
by controlling the internationally recognised state (the ‘gate’) and regulating access to the 
resources channelled into it from outside, including the allocation of development assistance, 
jobs, status, authority, and access to markets.16 Public resources are thus distributed in a 
private, discretionary fashion as a form of political patronage in exchange for political 
support. Beresford argues that the kind of ‘gatekeeper politics’ that emerges ‘is therefore not 
synonymous with corruption, though corruption is a pervasive symptom of it. Instead, it 
reflects something much broader: political and social structures through which authority and 
power are cultivated, disseminated, and contested.’17 It is important to recognise that this kind 
of patronage-based political system is not a uniquely “African” form of political aberration 
and breakdown, however.18 Furthermore, scholars have noted the need to be careful to 
identify the varying degrees to which such politics prevails across different African countries 
and the different forms it can take, which can in large part depend on the strength of the 
central state and the dynamics of capitalist development in each particular state. 19  

We will argue here that Sierra Leone exhibits one of the more extreme manifestations of 
the ‘recurrent crises’ described by Cooper that afflict some of Africa’s gatekeeper states, 
which we characterise as having several interconnected symptoms: 

 a weak economy premised primarily upon primary resource extraction 

 external dependency on international resources 

 volatile gatekeeper politics based on political patronage producing a weak state 
vulnerable to political upheavals 

 a state unable to provide basic services or perform basic social functions for the 
population 

Such an analysis stands in contrast to an emerging narrative among Western donors and 
investors celebrating ‘Africa’s rising’, pointing to a continent of ‘hopeful economies’ 
exhibiting relatively high levels of GDP growth rates, emerging middles classes and an 
increasingly large market of African consumers.20 This narrative has also been embraced, 
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with considerably less credibility, to celebrate Sierra Leone’s recent economic record since 
the war, including GDP growth of over 20 per cent before the EVD epidemic.21 The 
country’s most recent Poverty Reduction Strategy Paper (PRSP), the ‘Agenda for Prosperity 
(2013 – 2018)’, aims to build on what it calls the ‘tremendous progress’ achieved as a result 
of the previous ‘Agenda for Change (2008-2012)’ and contribute towards Sierra Leone’s 
‘epic journey to become a middle income country.’22 While mindful of the challenges that 
still confront the country, the World Bank has consistently noted the ‘remarkable strides and 
reforms’ the country has witnessed since the end of the civil war in 2002, and that as a result 
of its recent programmes of reform, ‘progress has been made, albeit at different levels, on 
most indicators of growth, poverty, MDGs, fragility, investment climate, and governance’.23 
     The ‘Africa rising’ narrative contains severe deficiencies, however. As Taylor notes, ‘the 
dynamics which are accompanying a notional “rise” of Africa’ are ‘actually contributing to 
the continent being pushed further and further into maldevelopment and dependency’.24 
Sierra Leone has historically been endowed with natural resources including iron ore, 
titanium ore, bauxite cocoa, rutile, diamonds, and also relatively fertile land with plenty of 
rainfall. However, as Zack-Williams observed back in the 1980s, little had been achieved 
since independence to diversify the economy and decrease the dependence on primary 
resource exports.25 Indeed, Sierra Leone’s recent growth is underpinned by a continued 
dependence on exporting iron ore in particular,26 highlighting the country’s narrow export 
base and its vulnerability to changes in the terms of trade.27 Little has therefore been achieved 
in terms of the long-term structural transformation of the economy and, as the IMF has 
recently argued, the recent ‘twin shocks’ of the EVD epidemic and a sharp drop in iron ore 
prices have ‘dealt a severe blow’ to this dependent economy.28 What growth has been 
achieved has done little to generate a sustainable tax base that could underpin an 
expansionary state agenda and Sierra Leone remains acutely dependent on external resources, 
which account for 80 percent of gross national income and reflect more than double the 
amount of annual government expenditures.29 
     Furthermore, Mkandawire argues that it is not simply the presence of growth alone that 
confirms Africa’s ‘rise’, and that we should remain critical of the kinds of economic growth 
that is taking in place, particularly when this exacerbates vast inequalities and social stress.30 
Despite rapid economic growth in Sierra Leone, any notion that this has ‘trickled down’ to 
the poorest in society is highly questionable. Sierra Leone continues to have some of the 
worst development statistics in the world and glaring social inequalities. 53 percent of the 
population were living below the poverty line in 2011 and this was particularly acute in rural 
areas, at 66 percent. It ranks close to the bottom of the Human Development Index (HDI), 
which assesses long term progress in living a long and healthy life, access to knowledge and 
a decent standard of living. 77 percent of the population are living in multidimensional 
poverty, in that they experience multiple deprivations in education, health and standard of 
living.31 Furthermore, rural populations, the poor, youth and women bore the brunt of the 
negative implications of externally-supported neoliberal Structural Adjustment Programmes 
(SAPs).32   
      While relations of global dependency have undoubtedly contributed to Sierra Leone’s 
enduring political and social crisis, we should nonetheless be careful not to overlook or 
downplay the manner in which African elites have participated in the processes which have 
inserted African societies as dependent partners in the global economy, as well as the manner 
in which the prominence of patron-client relations have exacerbated inequalities within these 
societies themselves.33 Harris argues that from the outset, the under-resourced colonial state 
was forced to forge linkages with traditional institutions such as the chieftaincy and to 
distribute the resources of the new state as a form of patronage in exchange for their loyalty.34 
Indeed, authors have long observed the distribution of public goods in Sierra Leone within 



5 

 

private networks of political patronage and how this has remained an enduring feature of elite 
survival strategies since independence.35 Reno argues that these patrimonial networks have 
remained essential to the exercise of power by the post-colonial elites through what he 
describes as the ‘shadow state’: a dense collection of ‘informal commercially orientated 
networks’ between global and local actors which operate alongside official government 
bureaucracies and formal state structures.36 Indeed, a ubiquitous feature of Sierra Leonean 
politics – like so many African states - has been entrenched structural violence in which 
livelihoods are premised upon the quality of access to these private, informal channels of 
resource and opportunity distribution controlled by a coterie of gatekeepers strategically 
placed within the parallel realms of authority of the state bureaucracy and traditional 
institutions like the chieftaincy.37   
     By the early 1990s this form of gatekeeper politics became increasingly volatile.  
Economic decline and endemic corruption generated a crisis for the state as the resources 
available for patronage networks began to dry up.38 The state elites responded by assuming 
an increasingly predatory and violent posture in relation to the wider population, and the 
state’s retreat from offering even basic social services to the population magnified existing 
social exclusion, generating resistance and, eventually, rebellion.39 
     By the time the war ended in 2002, the country’s already weak infrastructure and 
governmental capacity had been decimated. International attention was focused on Sierra 
Leone’s post-conflict reconstruction, making it a ‘test laboratory’ for liberal peace-building.40 
However, the economy is still heavily dependent on the outside world and the relatively small 
incomes it receives from the enclave extraction of minerals and, as discussed above, little has 
been achieved to address this.  Despite intensified liberal interventions promoting greater 
accountability and anti-corruption campaigns, political elites have proved remarkably adept 
at balancing donor demands for good governance and neoliberal reforms with the political 
prerogative of managing access to donor resources to further their political survival.41 
According to Transparency International, Sierra Leone was ranked 119 out of 175 territories 
and countries and scored 31 out of 100 in the Corruption Perceptions Index (2014) based on 
data from expert and business surveys.42 Meanwhile, donors have supported the state’s 
attempts to re-establish the powers of the traditional authorities (particularly the paramount 
chiefs) as part of efforts to promote the decentralisation of authority and encouraging local 
accountability. While these traditional authorities enjoy a degree of legitimacy among Sierra 
Leoneans, there are widespread concerns that they will continue to play the role of local 
gatekeepers whose discretionary control over access to resources and opportunities can 
reproduce social exclusion for those not included within their networks of patronage.43  
     This brief account of Sierra Leone’s political and economic fortunes therefore offers little 
to support the celebratory tone of the ‘Africa rising’ commentary. Instead, it offers an insight 
into a particularly acute manifestation of the recurrent crises of the gatekeeper state. The 
concern for the rest of this paper is how this contributed not only to the weakness of the state, 
and the consequent weakness of the country’s health system, but also to the structural 
violence experienced by its population that enabled the virus to spread so rapidly.  
 

A dependent health system in crisis 

In 2012 the WHO offered an optimistic outlook for Sierra Leone’s health system, arguing 
that ‘macroeconomic stability and economic growth will help reduce poverty, increase equity 
and enable the Government of Sierra Leone to allocate additional resources to the health 
sector’.44 However, once again, the limitations of this a priori assumption that economic 
growth would necessarily contribute to improving health provision are revealed when one 
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analyses the enduring symptoms of the gatekeeper state crisis in Sierra Leone and the impacts 
this has on the health sector.  
      First, the health sector is acutely dependent on external aid. In 2007, 78 per cent of 
resources were derived from external sources, with 12.9 million USD (42 percent) coming 
from the UK’s Department for International Development (DfID). The other key donors 
include the Global Fund, World Bank, Asian Development Bank, UNFPA and UNFPA. 
Despite the 15 percent pledged by the Abuja Declaration, the Ministry of Health and 
Sanitation (MoHS) receives only 8 percent of the government’s budget. Core health 
initiatives are heavily dependent on external funding in the absence of sufficient government 
resources, such as the government’s Free Healthcare Initiative (FHCI) to address maternal 
and infant health, which attracted considerable external resources: 87 per cent of the 
estimated $35m USD cost was funded by the development partners.45    
     As a result of this dependency, the government’s control over the health sector is severely 
compromised, as is its ability to set and coordinate a coherent health agenda at the national 
level. The government is influenced by the ‘swinging pendulum’46 of the constantly shifting 
priorities from the international donors and has to remain malleable to embracing externally 
defined health agendas, including the Alma Ata Declaration, the Ouagadougou Declaration, 
the Millennium Development Goals and the IMF/Bank PRSPs. Donors have promoted 
decentralisation and anti-corruption campaigns as a way of combating the misuse of funds in 
the health sector and increasing accountability.47 Meanwhile, NGOs often attempt to 
circumvent the state due to fears over corruption by funding and delivering individual 
projects according to their own priorities. This has led to the fermentation of multiple parallel 
health systems, some funded and managed through the government and others run by 
traditional healers, Faith-Based Organisations, international and local NGOs and also civil 
society organisations, which are often entirely reliant on either external funds or collecting 
private service fees. For example, Gavi, the global Vaccine Alliance for creating equal access 
to new and underused vaccines, represents another major funder in the health sector since 
2001. With 23.2m USD of direct funding for vaccines and 4.1m USD of cash-based support 
including for Immunisation Services Support (ISS) since 2001 and Health Systems 
Strengthening (HSS) from 2008.48 Despite the suspension of Gavi funding channelled 
through the state in 2012 due to fears about corruption, considered further below, Gavi itself 
continued to provide vaccines through alternative supply mechanisms and in other instances 
DfID directly funded health workers’ salaries rather than channelling assistance through the 
government.49

 These parallel structures of health care management and delivery have 
generated complexity and in some cases dysfunction, draining time and resources and 
reducing the capacity for oversight. For example, the Ministry of Health’s ‘National Health 
Sector Strategic Plan’ identified ‘weak sector coordination structures and arrangements at all 
levels’ between health service providers, ‘weak public private partnership (PPP) in the 
provision of comprehensive integrated health services’ and also ‘weak mechanisms for public 
accountability.’50 The government reports that a lack of harmonisation leads to ‘fragmented 
individual projects’, unpredictability, duplication, and a general lack of accountability.51 
Amnesty International also reports on the problems these parallel health systems present, 
arguing that ‘the lack of monitoring and oversight within the system has created a context 
where corruption can flourish’.52 
      Second, as Brown notes, while the power imbalance between donors and African elites in 
office can severely curtail the state’s autonomous control over policy, it is important to 
understand that this does not mean the entire ‘politico-legal independence’ of the state is 
being challenged.53 Instead, we have to examine the manner in which state actors compensate 
for their limited power through navigating and even exploiting their external dependency; 
what Bayart refers to as the ‘strategies of extraversion’ – putting on a show of compliance 
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with external agendas in order to preserve the flow of resources into the country.54 African 
state and non-state actors can play up their situations of dependence, problems and poverty as 
leverage for attracting resources.55

  
In this respect, even though the capacity for autonomous policy action and initiatives in 

the health sector is restricted by external agendas, rent-seeking opportunities are abundant. 
This is because considerable amounts of resources are directed into the health sector. For 
example, international concerns with ‘HIV exceptionalism’ generated considerable donor 
attention and funding for HIV/AIDS prevention and care (despite the low, stable prevalence) 
at the expense of tackling more pressing health challenges. In response, the Sierra 
Government (and some citizens) exaggerated this presentation of the country as one suffering 
from HIV in order to preserve this lucrative flow of resources for their own benefit.56At the 
same time, the complexity of health care provision undermines accountability by limiting 
processes for monitoring and evaluation. It is also, of course, a sector which is too significant 
to fail, and a complete cessation of funding would be politically unfeasible for donors. This 
has generated some high-profile corruption scandals. For example, in March 2010, the former 
Minister of Health, Sheiku Tejan Koroma, was convicted for abuse of office, abuse of 
position and failure to comply with procurement procedures.57 Even this seeming crackdown 
presented an opportunity in itself. With respect to the indictment of the Minister in 2009, for 
example, a cable from Freetown to the Economic Community of West African States 
(ECOWAS) suggests it was a strategy of extraversion: 
 

Sources told the Political Section that Koroma’s indictment appears deliberately timed 
to make a good impression on the donors before the Consultative Group meeting. 
According to several contacts, the ACC presented the indictment to the Attorney 
General (AG), who buried it for two months before it was moved forward in the 
court.58  
  

     Corruption and rent-seeking are not the preserve of state-elites with global connections 
alone, however. It is important to understand corruption as a multi-scaled phenomenon and 
that the gateways to resources extend well beyond the confines of the internationally 
recognised capital city. Reflecting the findings of studies elsewhere in Africa,59 ordinary 
health professionals will navigate the aid industry in order to secure the most lucrative returns 
available to them, often at the expense of the strength of the health system. It is reported, for 
example, that the issue of low salaries encourages health workers to seek informal increments 
to their wages, such as by charging patients illicit fees. This can undermine new initiatives. 
As part of the new FHCI project to offer basic health services without charges, President 
Ernest Bai Koroma announced plans to tackle this issue directly, declaring that: ‘Our doctors 
and nurses have been underpaid and overworked. As a consequence, it became a common 
practice for health workers to charge vulnerable patients inappropriately to make up for their 
inadequate salaries’.60 Nonetheless, the FHCI was severely undermined by the persistence of 
rent-seeking by health practitioners, who continued to supplement their meagre salaries 
through the illegal sale of medicines and health services that were now supposed to be free.61  
      Indeed, bureaucratic positions within the health sector offer health administrators a 
gatekeeping role through their control over access to resources and opportunities. This can 
provoke a range of corrupt, rent-seeking behaviour, including the creation of long lists of 
‘phantom workers’ connected to the gatekeeper who claim salaries but who do not actually 
work in the health sector. In other cases we can see the manipulation of resource flows, such 
as the hiring of sub-contractors personally connected to health administrators for work in the 
health sector who subsequently over charge for the work or fail to complete it.62 While 
donors often threaten to withdraw funding in the face of this rent-seeking, it is extremely 
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difficult to hold those responsible to account. For example, in 2012, the Gavi cash-based 
support was suspended after an external audit of the HSS programme. The MoHS was 
required to reimburse half a million USD of misused funds including for undocumented 
expenditure for trainings and workshops, overcharging for procurements (with three 
ambulances purchased for 80 percent higher than justifiable), and, the misappropriation of at 
least 14 motorcycles intended for peripheral health units.63 Funding from Gavi and DfID was 
subsequently suspended and was only resumed once the ‘Billiongate’ trial of the 29 public 
officials implicated in the misuse of the health systems funds commenced in March 2013. 
Ultimately, however, the trial illustrated the toothless nature of anti-corruption reforms and 
the capacity of political elites to resist pressures for greater accountability. Of the 29 accused, 
only two physicians were convicted in the High Court. Crucially, the key public officials 
were acquitted, including the Chief Medical Officer, the Director of Primary Health Care, the 
Programme Manager Productive Health, the Director of Human Resources and Nurses 
Services, and the Permanent Secretary of the MoHS.64 This was in spite of indirect evidence 
of large houses and expensive cars that were not consistent with official salaries, as well as 
kickbacks from suppliers.65 

In summary, the acute dependence on external funding in the health sector undermines the 
state control over its health policy and the multiplicity of donor agendas has generated the 
growth of a complex array of parallel health systems. Meanwhile, the volume of resources, 
combined with lack of accountability in the health sector provides rent-seeking opportunities 
for gatekeepers in positions of authority, which has exacerbated the weakness of the health 
system. These two trends have important consequences for containing the EVD epidemic.  
  
Ebola and strategies of extraversion 

When international attention focused on EVD – particularly with the fear of the threat it 
posed to the West – an influx of resources into the health sector followed, providing lucrative 
opportunities for rent-seeking and corruption. The government of Sierra Leone spent over 
Le84 billion (20.7 million USD) in response to the outbreak and appealed to donors for 
support. The European Union duly pledged over 1 billion EUR from March until November 
2014, the European Commission provided over 350 million EUR for humanitarian, 
development and research funds,66 the UK 205 million GBP67 and the Gates Foundation 
provided 50 million USD. The government established the National Ebola Response Centre 
(NERC) and a Health Emergency Account for all donations and appropriations to finance the 
response.68  

The regular ‘Ebola Outbreak Updates’ on the MoHS website and Facebook page 
(established in April 2014) was designed to offer greater transparency to a distrustful 
population but also to make direct appeals to external donors. Over time this included the 
‘important note’ at the end of the update with the Emergency Account Details and an appeal 
for direct cash transfers from those willing to help. Similarly, appeals were made from other 
sections of society for increased resources from outside. The Sierra Leone Telegraph, for 
example, directly appealed to global philanthropy in a piece entitled ‘Ebola strikes first 
female doctor in Sierra Leone – appeal to Bill Gates for help’:  

 
Please Mr. Bill Gates and Mrs Miranda Gates [sic], help our doctor, sister, mother, 
colleague and friend, help Sierra Leone. We need 300,000 Euros to fly Dr. Buck out 
of Sierra Leone and to pay for her treatment in Hamburg!69 

 
It has been widely reported that large proportions of the funding to combat EVD has been 

siphoned off and misappropriated by a range of actors.70 The government’s auditors concede 
that ‘Monies that have been set aside for the purpose of combating the Ebola outbreak may 
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have been used for unintended purposes, thereby slowing the government’s response to 
eradicate the virus.’71 Throughout the epidemic the government has encountered problems 
with ‘ghost workers’ on its Ebola staff payrolls, with some people forging identities or 
claiming for payments twice. A government spokesperson complains that ‘the issue of ghost 
workers has been disingenuous on the part of some Sierra Leoneans who think this is time to 
make money when we are in a crisis.’72 The Guardian also reports that   
 

Residents, journalists and an official told the Guardian that trucks carrying food aid 
were sometimes parked outside quarantine cordons, which intended recipients 
couldn’t cross. The food was then looted by those meant to be distributing it. Burial 
teams have repeatedly gone on strike over unpaid hazard allowances.73 
 

Indeed, Transparency International highlight that the ‘Systemic corruption in the health sector 
in West Africa hurt the response to the Ebola epidemic’.74 An in-depth ‘Report on the audit 
of the management of the Ebola funds’ by Sierra Leone’s Auditor General for May to 
October 2014 catalogues a series of issues with the way government money was spent, 
including: large payments and withdrawals of over Le14 billion (3.5 million USD) made 
from the Emergency Health Response and Miscellaneous Accounts ‘without any supporting 
documents to substantiate the utilisation of such funds’; a ‘complete disregard for the law’ 
during the public procurement of contractors and service providers to help contain EVD, 
meaning that the price paid was often overly inflated and poorly accounted for; the 
duplication of payments to politicians for their work communicating to their constituents 
about EVD; illegitimate claims by police and armed forces for hazard payments from 
hospitals; Le26 billion (6.4 million USD) paid out for healthcare workers’ ‘incentives’ that 
was not accounted for; poorly documented loans granted where ‘concern’ was expressed that 
these were being received by individuals and not the charities combating EVD; and the 
withholding of Le525 million (130,000 USD) tax payments by suppliers and contractors. 
Following the audit, the ACC commenced its investigations and identified 39 individuals that 
included high-profile public officials who are required to report to them in relation to the 
management of funds and associated issues.75 
     The opportunities generated by the surge in external resources being channelled into 
Sierra Leone’s health sector during the EVD epidemic thus reflected what might be 
characterised as a windfall moment within the context of an extended, recurrent crisis of the 
gatekeeper state. Access to the gateway of resources was suddenly and dramatically widened 
and extended to a range of individuals who, as best they could, sought to ‘do well’ out of the 
crisis. This windfall event was particularly conducive to rent seeking behaviour because the 
rubric of crisis necessitated an urgency which over-stretched an already weak state capacity 
to enforce accountability. However, we should not crudely dismiss this as some sort of 
uniquely ‘African’ moral aberration. First, the vast majority of Sierra Leoneans who engaged 
in efforts to contain EVD did so with great courage and at considerable personal risk, with 
little or no prospect of material reward.  Second, to understand rent-seeking behaviour we 
should focus on the political economy of ‘everyday corruption’ in Africa.76 In a situation 
where poverty and inequalities are vast and opportunities scarce, rent-seeking can be an 
integral feature of livelihoods strategies and, as Harris notes, in Sierra Leone ‘nepotism, 
diversion of resources and low levels of productivity can be explained by workers with moral 
communal obligations … to those they support and loyalties … to those who orchestrated 
their post in the first place.’77 

 
Structural violence in a predatory state  
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The recurrent political crises exacerbates structural violence by reproducing a ‘semi-
permanent state of exclusion’78 in Sierra Leone. Those able to successfully navigate 
patronage networks for their own benefit may benefit from it (albeit to varying degrees), 
while those excluded from access to resources have severely diminished opportunities 
(particularly the youth, rural population and women). The EVD laid bare the violence and 
exclusionary nature of the country’s gatekeeper politics, where it disproportionately impacted 
on certain segments of society it highlighted the existing social, economic and cultural 
patterns of exclusion.79 

One aspect of this exclusion relates to gender. Women are a resource within neoliberal 
development: their unpaid labour mitigated the impact of Structural Adjustment and they 
become ‘shock absorbers’ in times of crisis.80 In Sierra Leone, women’s unpaid labour in the 
care economy fills the gaps the health system and women have taken on much of the burden 
of care in the EVD outbreak. This has direct implications for their risk of contracting EVD 
and yet, as Harman argues, women are ‘conspicuously invisible’ in much of the commentary 
on EVD, which obscures the multiple roles of women.81  

Another is the entrenched rural-urban divide, which is crucial to understanding the state’s 
failure to respond effectively to contain the initial outbreak. The rural-urban cleavages are 
rooted in the legacies of the government’s “urban bias” policies that were intended to 
stimulate development but ‘became a mechanism for the transfer of resources from rural 
peasants to the country’s elite’.82 These structural inequalities were exacerbated by external 
interventions: the rural poor were disproportionately disadvantaged by the introduction of 
user fees for health services because they pay disproportionately more for health care as 
compared to wealthier households in terms of the percentage of their incomes.83 Even with 
the FHCI there were challenges in terms of accessing health care facilities in rural areas and, 
as we have already discussed, illicit costs for services that should be free. This has 
implications for containing EVD in rural areas. Farmer’s observations during the outbreak 
reveals the dearth of health centres in rural areas.  

 
In Zwedru, we visited the Grand Gedeh’s only hospital. Although there have been 
stories of doctors and nurses fleeing their posts, the fact is that many remain. But 
without personal protective equipment or other supplies, there isn’t a lot they can 
do… In Ziah Town, a small village a couple of hours away, we met some community 
health workers… They were the front line in the struggle against Ebola, the ones who 
could bring information and services to the rural poor. But they were isolated and 
badly equipped.84 

 
The real momentum to respond to the outbreak came with the shift in the infections from the 
East to the West of the country and the spread to urban areas. As Batty highlights, this laid 
bare deep mistrust between rural Sierra Leoneans and the Government, including the widely 
held assumptions that the response to the crisis was politically driven:  

 
Many wonder if the virus would have been approached differently if it had emerged in 
the northwest, where most of the senior [ruling party] APC officials, including the 
president, call “home.” Indeed, only as the disease crossed from the southeast into 
other parts of the country did the crisis response intensify and the government finally 
enlist the help of the international community to help fight Ebola.85 
 

Exclusion and isolation has engendered what the UNDP describes as a ‘pervasive distrust of 
politics’86 which had important consequences for the EVD epidemic.87 Government messages 
telling people how to recognise and avoid the disease, to go to hospital for treatment and safe 
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burial practices were largely ignored by the local populations. There were also reportedly 
fears among the local population that the government and aid agencies are intentionally 
spreading the virus and that the government wanted to sell patients’ blood or use limbs for 
rituals, which prompted a lack of cooperation with medical teams.88 There were also public 
perceptions of corruption surrounding EVD and conspiracy theories circulating that the virus 
was a government ruse to bring in donations89 or that so-called ‘eastbola’ was a strategy to 
depopulate the East of the country, which is the power-base of the opposition.90 Lind and 
Ndebe reflect that the EVD epidemic has thus ‘unmasked persisting deep public suspicion 
and mistrust of the state, laying bare the limits of post-conflict reconstruction to transform 
state-society relations’. They argue that the response has exacerbated social exclusion 
because ‘quarantines, aggressive policing, closed borders and other restrictions on people’s 
movements, hark back to military controls deployed during the region’s long wars, thereby 
further eroding trust and confidence in public authorities.’91  
      Despite the civil war ending, Sierra Leone is not at peace in the broadest sense. Structural 
violence shift our gaze to the ‘everyday violence’ of the enduring, lived reality of ‘small wars 
and invisible genocides’ that are a normalised feature of post-war West Africa.92 Ultimately, 
the EVD epidemic was not simply a medical crisis, but an infection that spread along the 
fault lines of the injustice generated by recurring political crises and deeply rooted structural 
violence. 
 
Conclusion: a way forward?  

Now that the immediate task of containing the virus has almost been achieved, the EVD 
epidemic is argued to constitute an ‘opportunity’ for a serious rethink of how global health 
risks can be dealt with more effectively in future. On the one hand, UK Prime Minister David 
Cameron worked with US President Barrack Obama to table a resolution to the WHO which 
called for the formation of a ‘global health emergency workforce’ that could respond to 
future epidemics and which would be ‘composed of comprehensive emergency medical 
response teams that can be deployed effectively and quickly with adequate resources’. The 
WHO Secretariat subsequently proposed this initiative as part of a wider reconfiguration of 
the international communities’ capacity to intervene in health emergencies.93 On the other 
hand, it is recognised that building resilient health systems requires much more than material 
resources. The WHO recognises in its rethinking of the ‘key principles’ of building health 
system resilience in the aftermath of the EVD outbreak that this includes: the coordination of 
development partners’ work; building each country’s core capacities to ‘detect, report and 
respond to public health emergencies’; enhancing ‘community trust, engagement and 
ownership’; and to reduce the financial costs of accessing health services. The report also 
called for more ‘predictable’ financial support for health systems that should not affect the 
country’s debt burdens.94 
    However, at its core, the prevailing emphasis on building health system ‘resilience’ as a 
means of facilitating the effective containment of future epidemics reflects a fundamental 
shortcoming in both the political understanding and political ambition needed to build 
stronger, inclusive health systems. It is not simply the case that the main actors are unaware 
of these political dynamics, and it is likely that there are political reasons that they have to 
focus on the technical ‘resilience-building’ approach. Since the end of the civil war we can 
witness a hybrid form of liberal peace-building in Sierra Leone informed to a large extent by 
an emerging mentality of ‘make do and mend’ among donors. The emphasis is placed on the 
need to reign in liberal expectations and settle for ‘good enough governance’ or ‘second best 
solutions.’95 This involves the continued promotion of liberal institutions but also the belief 
that the success of this project is premised upon securing popular legitimacy for them, not 
least the ‘buy-in’ of local power brokers. In Sierra Leone, this includes the resurrection 



12 

 

illiberal institutions such as the chieftaincy which, paradoxically, has been a focal point of 
societal tension in Sierra Leone throughout its history but also commands a degree of popular 
legitimacy that liberal state institutions might not.96 It has also meant an awkward embrace of 
the idea of working ‘with the grain’ of the logics of patron-client networks by identifying 
individuals in state authority who can be worked with to drive through change and directing 
authority and resources towards them, even if this does not preclude, and could even 
exacerbate, ongoing patronage politics. This hybrid liberal project offers little to challenge 
the structural inequity of the global system that entrenches the external dependency and 
enclave economic activity that contributes to the weakness of the state in the first place. 
Moreover, Harris notes that the tensions generated by this donor-driven hybrid approach are 
‘abundantly clear’ and that elites have displayed remarkable dexterity in their capacity to 
adjust to the ‘ever-evolving calculation’ of how to balance external demands for reform with 
their political prerogative of maintain power through dispensing patronage.97 Labonte argues 
that this reproduces social exclusion by leaving non-elites with little option other than to 
navigate ‘between liberal and illiberal governance institutions to accrue the kinds of public 
goods, justice and/or other necessities they need to survive.’98  
    This structural violence generated by the patched-up post-war political status quo in Sierra 
Leone has a debilitating impact on the health system and is acutely highlighted by the EVD 
epidemic. A less ambitious project of building health systems ‘resilience’ around the status 
quo therefore does little to address the more fundamental structural transformation required to 
build more inclusive and socially just health systems in future. Such a project would require a 
much broader conversation about HSS and an ambition to address a range of interconnected 
issues, including: Sierra Leone’s dependent position in the world economy and its reliance on 
mineral exports; the need for a sustained redistribution of global wealth to underpin an 
expansionary state programme for the sectors fundamental to the health system, in particular 
higher education and health infrastructure; measures to decrease the ‘brain drain’ of skilled 
medical staff by ending externally-promoted austerity measures that limit medical staff 
salaries; and ending user fees for medical services and medicines. This is by no means an 
exhaustive list. It nonetheless seeks to illuminate the kinds of wider conversations that would 
be needed to shift away from the emerging a agenda of building coping mechanisms and 
health systems ‘resilience’ towards a long-term, more ambitious agenda of HSS through 
tackling some of the great challenges posed by the recurrent crises of the gatekeeper state and 
the injustice it reproduces.   
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